
Bid 2024-07 Event Equipment Rental Services 

Item # Item Description Approx. Size Qty. Unit Price Extended Total
W-1 Water Slide 1 Lane L25’xW18’xH22’ 1 $700.00 $700.00
W-2 Water Slide 1 Lane L39’xW14'xH22’ 1 $850.00 $850.00
W-3 Water Slide 2 Lane L36'X W14'xH19' 1 $675.00 $675.00
W-4 Water Slide 2 Lane L25'xW18'xH22' 1 $850.00 $850.00
W-5 Water Slide 2 Lane L35'xW17'xH20' 1 $675.00 $675.00
W-6 Water Slide 3 Lane L33'xW17'xH16' 1 $700.00 $700.00
W-7 Water Slide 3 Lane L33'xW10'xH18' 1 $700.00 $700.00
W-8 40' Obstacle L40'xW11'xH12' 1 $625.00 $625.00
W-9 Double Lane Slip N' Slide L30'xW11'xH10' 1 $525.00 $525.00

W-10 Obstacle Course L45'xW26'xH16' 1 $725.00 $725.00
W-11 Car Wash Walk Through L36'xW11'xH12' 1 $500.00 $500.00

W-12
Water Slide  with Pool 32’ & Slip N' 
Slide

L85'xW32'xH32' 1 $1,675.00 $1,675.00

W-13 Floating Slide L24’xW17’XH9’ 1 $725.00 $725.00
W-14 Water Tag 20' x 20' 1 $1,550.00 $1,550.00
W-15 Dunk Tank 550 gals. 10x10 1 $400.00 $400.00

$11,875.00

Item # Item Description Size Qty. Unit Price Extended Total
WD-1 Obstacle Course L40’xW11’xH13’ 1 $625.00 $625.00

WD-2
Bouncing House with  Entanglement, 
along with Climbing and Sliding Lanes

L18'xW20’xH16’ 1 $500.00 $500.00

WD-3 5 in 1 Combos (Wet/Dry) L18'xW19'xH15' 1 $500.00 $500.00
$1,625.00

Party Perfect Rentals, LLC                    
312 Squankum Yellowbrook Rd.       

Farmingdale NJ 07727

TOTAL OF WATER EQUIPMENT RENTALS Items W1 –W15

TOTAL OF WET/DRY EQUIPMENT RENTALS Items WD1 – WD-3



Bid 2024-07 Event Equipment Rental Services 

Item # Item Description Size Qty. Unit Price Extended Total
NW-1  4 Player Interactive 30’ circle 1 $1,750.00 $1,750.00
NW-2 120’ Obstacle Course L120'xW10'xH20' 1 $1,950.00 $1,950.00

NW-3 Trackless Train
3 Passenger Cars & 
Engine

1 $800.00 $800.00

NW-4 Ferris Wheel 5 in 1 Combo 18'L x 19'W x 17"H 1 $500.00 $500.00
NW-5 Race to the top L35'xW35'xH8' 1 $750.00 $750.00
NW-6 Carnival Theme Bouncer L18’ x W20’ x H16’ 1 $400.00 $400.00

NW-7
3 Play Sports (Soccer, Basketball & 
Football)

L21'xW18'xH16' 1 $475.00 $475.00

NW-8 Obstacle Course-3 Lane L65'xW11'xH22' 1 $800.00 $800.00
NW-9 52’ Obstacle with Slide L52'xW11'xH15' 1 $700.00 $700.00

NW-10 Bungee Joust/Combo L30'xW17'xH9' 1 $625.00 $625.00
NW-11 Velcro Wall L22'xW12'xH13' 1 $550.00 $550.00
NW-12 Bungee Basketball L31'xW13'xH7' 1 $575.00 $575.00
NW-13 4 in 1 Sports L18'xW28'xH15' 1 $575.00 $575.00
NW-14 22’ Multi-Colored Two Lane Slide L30'xW14'xH22' 1 $775.00 $775.00
NW-15 22' Slide 2 Lane L25'xW18'xH22' 1 $775.00 $775.00
NW-16 Bounce House L30'xW30'xH16' 1 $875.00 $875.00
NW-17 Interactive Sports (5 Games) L36'xW28'xH21' 1 $575.00 $575.00
NW-18 Toddler Fun House L22'xW21'xH8' 1 $500.00 $500.00
NW-19 Mechanical Bull 15'x15' 1 $1,400.00 $1,400.00
NW-20 24' Mechanical 4 Person Rock Wall L30' x W30' x H 24' 1 $1,400.00 $1,400.00
NW-21 Bungee Trampoline 30’ area 1 $1,750.00 $1,750.00
NW-22 Human Snow Globe n/a 1 $950.00 $950.00
NW-23 Mechanical Mini Tea Cups n/a 1 $1,900.00 $1,900.00
NW-24 Ball Race Track L75'xW30'xH1.5' 1 No Bid No Bid 
NW-25 40 ‘ Sports Obstacle L 40' x W11' x H12' 1 $625.00 $625.00
NW-26 Bungee Run L25'xW12'xH7' 1 $475.00 $475.00
NW-27 Custom Bouncer L15'xW15'xH13' 1 $325.00 $325.00
NW-28 5 in 1 Carnival Inflatable L16'xW16'xH11' 1 $550.00 $550.00
NW-29 Foam Cannon 30’ area 1 $350.00 $350.00
NW-30 Dixie  Cup Spring & Swing Ride 40’ area 1 $1,750.00 $1,750.00
NW-31 Fun House Maze L35'xW40'xH11' 1 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
NW-32 Winter Themed Bouncer L17'xW17'xH27' 1 $750.00 $750.00
NW-33 8 Player Mechanical Action Game 30'x30' octagon 1 $1,650.00 $1,650.00

NW-34 Army Themed Obstacle Course Bouncer L85'xW12'xH16' 1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

Party Perfect Rentals, LLC                    
312 Squankum Yellowbrook Rd.       

Farmingdale NJ 07727

$30,025.00TOTAL OF NON-WATER EQUIPMENT RENTALS Items NW1 – NW34



Bid 2024-07 Event Equipment Rental Services 

Item # Item Description Size Qty. Unit Price Extended Total
T-1 Frame Tent – 15-20 Guests 15’ x 15’ 1 $375.00 $375.00
T-2 Frame Tent – 25-30 Guests 15’ x 20’ 1 $525.00 $525.00
T-3 Frame Tent – 30-35 Guests 15’ x 30 1 $650.00 $650.00
T-4 Frame Tent – 15-25 Guests 16’ x 16’ 1 $375.00 $375.00
T-5 Frame Tent – 40-50 Guests 16’ x 32 ‘ 1 $675.00 $675.00
T-6 Frame Tent – 60-75 Guests 16’ x 48’ 1 $875.00 $875.00
T-7 Frame Tent – 30-40 Guests 20’ x 20’ 1 $475.00 $475.00
T-8 Frame Tent – 50-60 Guests 20’ x 30’ 1 $575.00 $575.00
T-9 Frame Tent – 65-80 Guests 20’ x 40’ 1 $675.00 $675.00

T-10 Frame Tent – 80-100 Guests 20’ x 50’ 1 $825.00 $825.00
T-11 Frame Tent – 95-120 Guests 20’ x 60’ 1 $975.00 $975.00
T-12 Frame Tent – 125-160 Guests 20’ x 80’ 1 $1,475.00 $1,475.00
T-13 Frame Tent – 145-180 Guests 20’ x 90’ 1 $1,725.00 $1,725.00
T-14 Frame Tent – 160-200 Guests 20’x100’ 1 $1,975.00 $1,975.00
T-15 Frame Tent – 70-90 Guests 30’ x 30 1 $750.00 $750.00
T-16 Frame Tent – 100-135 Guests 30’ x 45’ 1 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
T-17 Frame Tent – 120-150 Guests 30’ x 50’ 1 $1,300.00 $1,300.00
T-18 Frame Tent – 145-180 Guests 30’ x 60’ 1 $1,550.00 $1,550.00
T-19 Frame Tent – 190-225 Guests 30’ x 75 1 $1,850.00 $1,850.00
T-20 Frame Tent – 215-270 Guests 30’ x 90’ 1 $2,100.00 $2,100.00
T-21 Frame Tent – 240-300 Guests 30’ x 100’ 1 $2,250.00 $2,250.00
T-22 Frame Tent – 125-160 Guests 40’ x 40’ 1 $1,695.00 $1,695.00
T-23 Frame Tent – 160-200 Guests 40’ x 50’ 1 $2,125.00 $2,125.00
T-24 Frame Tent – 225-320 Guests 40’ x 80’ 1 $3,400.00 $3,400.00
T-25 Frame Tent – 320-400 Guests 40’ x 100’ 1 $4,175.00 $4,175.00
T-26 Frame Tent – 375-475 Guest 40’ x 120’ 1 $4,950.00 $4,950.00
T-27 Canopy Tent – 20-25 Guests 16’ x 16’ 1 $375.00 $375.00
T-28 Canopy Tent – 30-40 Guests 20’ x 20’ 1 $475.00 $475.00
T-29 High-Peak Frame Tent – 5-10 Guests 10’ x 10’ 1 $180.00 $180.00
T-30 High-Peak Frame Tent – 15-20 Guests 10’ x 20’ 1 $350.00 $350.00
T-31 High-Peak Frame Tent – 15-20 Guests 15’ x 15’ 1 $375.00 $375.00
T-32 High-Peak Frame Tent – 30-40 Guests 20’ x 20’ 1 $475.00 $475.00
T-33 High-Peak Frame Tent – 45-60 Guests 20’ x 30’ 1 $575.00 $575.00
T-34 High-Peak Frame Tent – 60-80 Guests 20’ x 40’ 1 $675.00 $675.00
T-35 Side Wall – Windowed 10’ 1 $20.00 $20.00
T-36 Side Wall – Solid 10’ 1 $20.00 $20.00
T-37 Side Wall – Windowed 15’ 1 $30.00 $30.00

Party Perfect Rentals, LLC                    
312 Squankum Yellowbrook Rd.       

Farmingdale NJ 07727



Bid 2024-07 Event Equipment Rental Services 

T-38 Side Wall – Solid 15’ 1 $30.00 $30.00
T-39 Side Wall – Windowed 20’ 1 $40.00 $40.00
T-40 Side Wall – Solid 20’ 1 $40.00 $40.00
T-41 Side Wall – Windowed 30’ 1 $60.00 $60.00
T-42 Side Wall – Solid 30’ 1 $60.00 $60.00

T-43
Carnival (Red & White Striped) Canopy 
Tent – 20-25 Guests 

16’ x 16’ 1 $375.00 $375.00

T-44 Lifeguard Tent 10’x10’ 1 $180.00 $180.00

Item # Item Description Size Qty Unit Price Extended Total
TC-1 Table – Round 36” 1 $12.00 $12.00
TC-2 Table Round 48” 1 $13.00 $13.00
TC-3 Table – Round 60” 1 $15.00 $15.00
TC-4 Table – Round 72” 1 $16.00 $16.00
TC-5 Table Cloth – Round 60” 1 $15.00 $15.00
TC-6 Cocktail Table – Round 30” 1 $15.00 $15.00
TC-7 4 ft. Banquet Table 48” x 30” 1 $11.00 $11.00
TC-8 6 ft. Banquet Table 72” x 30” 1 $12.00 $12.00
TC-9 8 ft. Banquet Table 96” x 30 10 $13.00 $130.00

TC-10 Kiddie Table 
72” x 30”          20” 
high

1 $10.00 $10.00

TC-11 Fill and Chill Table
73” x 31”           6 ½” 
deep

1 $75.00 $75.00

TC-12
White Folding Chair – white metal 
frame & white plastic seat and back 

N/A 50 $2.75 $137.50

TC-13
Kiddie Folding Chair – white frame with 
white plastic seat and back 

N/A 10 $2.75 $27.50

TC-14
White Padded Folding Chair – white 
frame with white padded seat and back 

N/A 25 $4.00 $100.00

TC-15
Chavari Chairs – Gold or Silver frames 
no padding  

N/A 1 $8.00 $8.00

TC-16
Portable Bleacher Seating 20-40 people 
with upper railing 

N/A 1 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL OF TENT RENTALS Items T1 – T44

Party Perfect Rentals, LLC                    
312 Squankum Yellowbrook Rd.       

Farmingdale NJ 07727

$43,855.00

TOTAL OF CHAIR RENTALS Items TC-1 - TC-16 $597.00



Bid 2024-07 Event Equipment Rental Services 

Item # Item Description Size Qty. Unit Price Extended Total
L-1 Round Table Linen 72” 1 $23.00 $23.00
L-2 Round Table Linen 90” 1 $12.00 $12.00
L-3 Round Table Linen 108” 1 $15.00 $15.00
L-4 Rectangular Table Linen – Color TBD 72” x 120” 1 $13.00 $13.00
L-5 Rectangular Table Linen – Color TBD 90” x 132 1 $24.00 $24.00
L-6 Rectangular Table Linen – Color TBD 90” x 156” 1 $25.50 $25.50

$112.50

Item # Item Description Size Qty. Unit Price Extended Total

F- 1

Popcorn Machine, Popcorn, oil, serving 
container and all other appropriate 
materials for the operation of the 
Popcorn Machine 

Approx. 2,000 guests - $1,100.00 $1,100.00

F 2

Cotton Candy Machine, Sugar, cones 
and all other appropriate materials for 
the operation of the Cotton Candy 
Machine 

Approx. 2,000 guests - $1,100.00 $1,100.00

$2,200.00

Item # Item Description Size Qty. Unit Price Extended Total
S-1 4’ x 4’ Stage Up to 2’ high - $50.00 $50.00
S-2 4’ x 4’ Stage Up to 4’ high - $50.00 $50.00
S-3 Stage Stairs Up to 2’ high - $85.00 $85.00
S-4 Stage Stairs Up to 4’ high - $85.00 $85.00
S-5 Handicap Stage Ramp Up to 4’ high - No Bid No Bid
S-6 Stage Railing for 4’ x 4’ Stage Min height 4’ - $25.00 $25.00
S-7 Stage Skirt for 4’ x 4’ Stage Up to 2’ high - $10.00 $10.00
S-8 Stage Skirt for 4’ x 4’ Stage Up to 4’ high - $10.00 $10.00

S-9 Stage Carpet per Sq. Ft.
20        

sq. ft.
$1.50 $30.00

S-10 Dance Floor 
Per Sq. Ft. * -Offered 
at Per 4'x4' sections

20   sq. 
ft.

$45.00 $45.00

S-11 Deck Flooring  Per Sq. Ft. 
20   sq. 

ft.
$1.50 $30.00

$420.00TOTAL OF STAGING & FLOORING                              

Party Perfect Rentals, LLC                    
312 Squankum Yellowbrook Rd.       

Farmingdale NJ 07727

TOTAL OF LINEN RENTALS Items L1 – L6

TOTAL OF FOOD & MATERIALS                                     



Bid 2024-07 Event Equipment Rental Services 

Item # Item Description Size Qty Unit Price Extended Total
A-1 Large Movie Screen 9’ 1 $600.00 $600.00
A-2 Giant Movie Screen 18’ 1 $900.00 $900.00
A-3 Jumbo Movie Screen 35’ 1 $1,700.00 $1,700.00
A-4 FM Transmitter N/A 1 $250.00 $250.00
A-5 LED Projector N/A 1 $150.00 $150.00
A-6 Wireless Microphone N/A 1 $75.00 $75.00
A-7 Wired Microphone N/A 1 $50.00 $50.00

A-8
Portable PA System – Tailgater or 
equivalent  

N/A 1 $250.00 $250.00

A-9
PA System – to include 4 speakers and 
all applicable hardware for indoor or 
outdoor use 

N/A 1 $400.00 $400.00

A-10
Photo Booth with unlimited sessions/ 
photos

1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

Item # Item Description Size Qty Unit Price Extended Total
M-1 Tent Fan N/A 1 $80.00 $80.00
M-2 Misting Fan N/A 1 $150.00 $150.00
M-3 Tent Heater N/A 1 $375.00 $375.00
M-4 Outdoor Heater N/A 1 $125.00 $125.00
M-5 Umbrella 48” 1 $22.00 $22.00
M-6 Bleacher seating 3 Row 1 No Bid No Bid 
M-7 Generator 7500 Watt 1 $150.00 $150.00

$902.00

Total of All Sections $96,986.50

TOTAL OF MISC. RENTALS Items M1 – M7

Party Perfect Rentals, LLC                    
312 Squankum Yellowbrook Rd.       

Farmingdale NJ 07727

TOTAL OF VIDEO & AUDIO                                                                                               
RENTALS Items A1 - A10

$5,375.00


